

# SANITATION SERVICES FOR CITY-OWNED FACILITIES AND RESIDENTIAL OPT-OUT PROGRAM

Bid Opening - 5/7/2019

## BID TABULATION

RESIDENTIAL OPT-OUT PROGRAM (OPTIONS 1, 2, 3, and 4)	KIMBLE RECYCLING & DISPOSAL, INC.		OHIO DISPOSAL, LLC	
	COST PER MONTH PER CUSTOMER		COST PER MONTH PER CUSTOMER	
	CURBSIDE	SET BACK	CURBSIDE	SET BACK
<b>OPTION 1 (Year-Round Garbage &amp; Recyclables Pick-up, and 6-Week Leaf Recycling Program)</b>				
Garbage, Rubbish, Yard Waste & Misc.	\$19.05	\$39.35	No Bid	No Bid
Recyclables Pickup	Included	Included	No Bid	No Bid
6-Week Leaf Recycling Program	Included	N/A	No Bid	N/A
<b>TOTAL</b>	\$19.05	\$39.35	No Bid	No Bid
<b>OPTION 2 (Year-Round Garbage &amp; Recyclables Pick-up, 6-Week Fall Leaf Recycling Program, and 6-Week Spring/Summer Yard Waste Recycling Program)</b>				
Garbage, Rubbish, Yard Waste & Misc.	\$19.05	\$39.35	No Bid	No Bid
Recyclables Pickup	Included	Included	No Bid	No Bid
6-Week Leaf Recycling Program (Fall)	Included	N/A	No Bid	N/A
6-Week Yard Waste Recycling Program (Spring/Summer)	Included	N/A	No Bid	N/A
<b>TOTAL</b>	\$19.05	\$39.35	No Bid	No Bid
<b>OPTION 3 (Year-Round Garbage &amp; Recyclables Pick-up, and 9-Month Yard Waste Recycling Program)</b>				
Garbage, Rubbish, Yard Waste & Misc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Recyclables Pickup	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9-Month Yard Waste Recycling Program	No Bid	N/A	No Bid	N/A
<b>TOTAL</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

# SANITATION SERVICES FOR CITY-OWNED FACILITIES AND RESIDENTIAL OPT-OUT PROGRAM

Bid Opening - 5/7/2019

## BID TABULATION

	KIMBLE RECYCLING & DISPOSAL, INC.	OHIO DISPOSAL, LLC
<b>RESIDENTIAL OPT-OUT PROGRAM (OPTIONS 1, 2, 3, and 4)</b>	<b>COST PER MONTH PER CUSTOMER</b>	<b>COST PER MONTH PER CUSTOMER</b>
<b>OPTION 4 (Add-ons and Modifiers)</b>		
Small Volume Producers	\$4.00	No Bid
<u>Price Per Bag:</u>		
Number of bags per purchase	10 Bags at \$4.00 Each	No Bid
Min. # of bags that must be purchased in 6 mo. period	10 Bags at \$4.00 Each	No Bid
Bulk Items (Without Freon)	\$45.00 Each	No Bid
Bulk Items (With Freon)	\$100.00 Each	No Bid
Large Wheeled Containers:		
Will large wheeled containers be offered?	YES	NO
If offered, will they be included in monthly base rate?	YES	NO
If not included in monthly base rate, additional monthly cost	Included	
If offered, will a deposit be required?	YES	NO
If yes, amount of deposit	N/A	
<b>RESIDENTIAL OPT-OUT PROGRAM (OPTIONS 1, 2, 3, and 4)</b>	<b>PERCENTAGE</b>	<b>PERCENTAGE</b>
<b>PRICE ALLOCATION PERCENTAGES (For Options 1-4)</b>		
Fuel	14%	N/A
Labor	22%	N/A
Equipment Cost	15%	N/A
Landfill Cost (Without Tipping Fees)	29%	N/A
Landfill Cost (Tipping Fees Only)	12%	N/A
Administrative	5%	N/A
Other	3%	N/A
<b>TOTAL</b>	100%	N/A

# SANITATION SERVICES FOR CITY-OWNED FACILITIES AND RESIDENTIAL OPT-OUT PROGRAM

Bid Opening - 5/7/2019

## BID TABULATION

	KIMBLE RECYCLING & DISPOSAL, INC.	OHIO DISPOSAL, LLC
CITY-OWNED FACILITIES (OPTION 5)	TOTAL COST FOR 3 YEARS	TOTAL COST FOR 3 YEARS
<b>OPTION 5 (By Collection Site)</b>		
Stow City Hall	\$8,280.00	\$4,320.00
Stow City Hall - Recycled Materials (Paper/Cardboard)	\$3,060.00	\$1,620.00
Safety Building	\$9,180.00	\$4,750.00
Municipal Court	\$3,420.00	\$1,980.00
SKiP Playground (April thru November)	\$6,120.00	\$3,540.00
SKiP Playground (December thru March)	\$660.00	\$520.00
Service Center	\$16,020.00	\$9,360.00
Fire Station #2	\$5,580.00	\$3,240.00
Fire Station #3	\$5,580.00	\$3,240.00
Adell Durbin Park	\$6,300.00	\$3,960.00
Stow Cemetery (March thru October)	\$4,200.00	\$2,160.00
Stow Cemetery (November thru February)	\$1,140.00	\$880.00
Silver Springs Lodge	\$11,340.00	\$5,940.00
Silver Springs Park Ballfield (April thru October)	\$6,615.00	\$3,657.00
Silver Springs Park Ballfield (November thru March)	\$975.00	\$750.00
Silver Springs Campground	\$3,255.00	\$1,440.00
Heritage Barn	\$6,300.00	\$3,960.00
Oregon Trails	\$3,420.00	\$1,980.00
Community Garden	\$5,580.00	\$3,240.00
Fox Den Golf Course (March thru November)	\$10,125.00	\$7,560.00
Fox Den Golf Course (December thru February)	\$3,375.00	\$720.00
<b>OPTIONS (Additional Pick-ups as Needed by the City)</b>	<b>COST PER CONTAINER</b>	<b>COST PER CONTAINER</b>
Recycle Tote	\$30.00 per Month per Cart, Weekly Service	No Bid
5 City Cans - 30 Gal.	\$30.00 per Month per Can, Weekly Service	No Bid
3 C.Y.	\$60.00	\$30.00
4 C.Y.	\$70.00	\$35.00
6 C.Y.	\$80.00	\$40.00
Commercial Roll Off (Flat Fee)	Not Bid as Flat Fee	\$375.00 (25 Yard) \$475.00 (40 Yard)
Other (Flat Fee)	No Bid	No Bid