

City of Stow
PURCHASE OF MATERIALS
(Items with Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - MAY 2, 2019

DESCRIPTION	ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE	A & A SAFETY, INC.	BARBICAS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.	CHAGRIN VALLEY PAVING, INC.	J.D. STRIPING & SERVICES, INC.	KARVO COMPANIES, INC.	LOCKHART CONCRETE CO.	PERRIN ASPHALT COMPANY	SPANO BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION
TOTAL FOR ITEM 1 - Asphaltic Materials on City Streets (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required)	\$2,175,485.00	No Bid	\$2,139,755.00	\$1,985,940.00	No Bid	\$1,801,536.00	No Bid	\$1,804,095.00	No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM 2 - Asphaltic Materials on Other City Infrastructure (Parking Lots and Paths) (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required)	\$252,130.00	No Bid	\$290,990.50	\$235,525.00	No Bid	\$252,224.00	No Bid	\$243,485.00	No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM 3 - Concrete - Finished, In Place	\$624,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$618,200.00	\$577,800.00	\$516,240.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 4 - Fast Dry Water-Based Paint (Roadway Striping)	\$92,075.00	\$63,440.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$67,085.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid