

City of Stow
PURCHASE OF MATERIALS
(Items with Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - APRIL 12, 2018

DESCRIPTION	ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE	A & A SAFETY, INC.	BARBICAS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.	CHAGRIN VALLEY PAVING, INC.	J.D. STRIPING & SERVICES, INC.	KARVO COMPANIES, INC.	LOCKHART CONCRETE CO.	PERRIN ASPHALT COMPANY	SPANO BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.
TOTAL FOR ITEM 1 - Asphaltic Materials on City Streets (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required)	\$1,802,202.50	No Bid	\$1,805,058.50	\$1,782,810.00	No Bid	\$1,463,773.10	No Bid	\$1,589,544.50	No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM 2 - Asphaltic Materials on Other City Infrastructure [Parking Lots and Paths] (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required)	\$135,600.00	No Bid	\$144,450.00	\$122,250.00	No Bid	\$139,398.00	No Bid	\$117,200.00	No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM 3 - Concrete - Finished, In Place	\$601,750.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$618,500.00	\$508,025.00	\$558,825.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 4 - Fast Dry Water-Based Paint (Roadway Striping)	\$83,000.00	\$69,155.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$60,915.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid