

City of Stow
PROGRESS PARK WATERLINE INSTALLATION

Bid Opening - November 14, 2017

COMPANY	TOTAL BASE BID	TOTAL ALTERNATE BID
Fioritto Construction, LLC	\$438,735.92	No Bid
J.S. Bova Excavating, LLC	\$355,400.55	\$307,808.00
Karvo Companies, Inc.	\$398,396.52	No Bid
M. Campbell Contracting, LLC	\$336,010.00	No Bid
Mr. Excavator, Inc.	\$436,112.41	\$412,583.74
1127 Construction, Inc.	\$357,389.00	\$300,300.00
Rudzik Excavating, Inc. (Bid As Read) *Error Found (Total as Calculated by Public Service Dept.)	\$294,060.78 \$294,060.79	No Bid
Spano Brothers Construction Co., Inc.	\$389,810.04	No Bid
Utility Contracting, Inc.	\$387,124.66	No Bid
Wenger Excavating, Inc.	\$453,926.22	\$463,409.00
Woodford Excavating, LLC	\$460,953.45	No Bid
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE	\$382,404.30	\$349,125.00