

**City of Stow**  
**PURCHASE OF MATERIALS**  
*(Items with Prevailing Wages)*

**BID OPENING - JUNE 6, 2017**

DESCRIPTION	ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE	BARBICAS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.	CHAGRIN VALLEY PAVING, INC.	J.D. STRIPING & SERVICES, INC.	KARVO COMPANIES, INC.	LOCKHART CONCRETE CO.	PERRIN ASPHALT COMPANY	SPANO BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 1</b> - Asphaltic Materials on City Streets (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required)	\$1,544,575.00	\$1,487,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,227,400.00	No Bid	\$1,204,050.00	No Bid
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 2</b> - Asphaltic Materials on Other City Infrastructure [Parking Lots and Paths] (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required)	\$315,375.00	\$274,830.00	\$270,075.00	No Bid	\$254,450.00	No Bid	\$207,230.00	No Bid
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 3</b> - Concrete - Finished, In Place	\$402,150.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$451,750.00	\$380,210.00	\$444,367.50
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 4</b> - Fast Dry Water-Based Paint (Roadway Striping)	\$74,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$61,680.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid