City of Stow
PURCHASE OF MATERIALS
(Iltems with Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - MAY 31, 2016

BARBICAS KENMORE
. CHAGRIN VALLEY J.D. STRIPING & KARVO COMPANIES, LOCKHART CONCRETE M. CAMPBELL OGLESBY PERRIN ASPHALT SPANO BROTHERS
DESCRIPTION ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE | A & A SAFETY, INC. CONSTRIL’I\‘%TION CO., | CEMENTECH, INC. PG &, SRS N, INC. CONSTRIL’I\‘%TION co., o CETRATIG, UG || ConSTuETE e, T S NETROCTON

TOTAL FOR ITEM 4B - Asphaltic $1,660,665.00
Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand (Bid as Read)

fat " $1,710,085.00 No Bid (Error Found - Bid as No Bid $1,996,560.00 No Bid $1,383,574.00 $1,655,285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,419,580.00 No Bid
Finished & Rolled as Required) on City
Streets Calculated by City of

Stow - $1,660,655.00)

TOTAL FOR ITEM 4C - Asphaltic
Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand
Finished & Rolled as Required) on $53,767.50 No Bid $48,278.20 No Bid $104,982.25 No Bid $51,913.45 $74,431.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $49,968.25 No Bid
Other City Infrastructure (Parking Lots
and Paths)
;ﬁLAh';dF?nRF!;EZ 5B - Conorete - $584,712.50 No Bid No Bid $486,545.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $684,700.00 $541,750.00 No Bid $559,132.50 $542,572.50
TOTAL FOR ITEM 12 - Fast Dry Water- N/A $66,179.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $58,277.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69,393.00 No Bid No Bid
Based Paint (Roadway Striping)




