City of Stow PURCHASE OF MATERIALS (Items with Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - JUNE 2, 2015

DESCRIPTION	A & A SAFETY, INC.	AMERICAN ROADWAY LOGISTICS, INC.	BARBICAS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.	CHAGRIN VALLEY PAVING, INC.	J.D. STRIPING & SERVICES, INC.	KARVO PAVING COMPANY	M. CAMPBELL CONTRACTING, LLC	OGLESBY CONSTRUCTION, INC.	PERRIN ASPHALT COMPANY
TOTAL FOR ITEM 4B - Asphaltic Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required) on City Streets	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,538,860.00	\$1,461,820.00	No Bid	\$1,206,345.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,196,700.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 4C - Asphaltic Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required) on Other City Infrastructure (Parking Lots and Paths)	No Bid	No Bid	\$93,625.00	\$118,255.00	No Bid	\$63,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$64,670.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 5B - Concrete - Finished, In Place	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$470,200.00	No Bid	\$521,725.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 12 - Fast Dry Water-Based Paint (Roadway Striping)	\$57,430.00	\$40,730.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$47,545.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$65,739.00	No Bid

City of Stow PURCHASE OF MATERIALS (Items with Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - JUNE 2, 2015

DESCRIPTION	A & A SAFETY, INC.	AMERICAN ROADWAY LOGISTICS, INC.	BARBICAS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.	CHAGRIN VALLEY PAVING, INC.	J.D. STRIPING & SERVICES, INC.	KARVO PAVING COMPANY	M. CAMPBELL CONTRACTING, LLC	OGLESBY CONSTRUCTION, INC.	PERRIN ASPHALT COMPANY
TOTAL FOR ITEM 4B - Asphaltic Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required) on City Streets	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,538,860.00	\$1,461,820.00	No Bid	\$1,206,345.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,196,700.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 4C - Asphaltic Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required) on Other City Infrastructure (Parking Lots and Paths)	No Bid	No Bid	\$93,625.00	\$118,255.00	No Bid	\$63,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$64,670.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 5B - Concrete - Finished, In Place	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$470,200.00	No Bid	\$521,725.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 12 - Fast Dry Water-Based Paint (Roadway Striping)	\$57,430.00	\$40,730.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$47,545.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$65,739.00	No Bid