

City of Stow

MISCELLANEOUS STORM SEWER PROJECTS - 2015

6/25/2015

PROJECT	ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE	INLAND WATERS POLLUTION CONTROL, INC.	INSIGHT PIPE CONTRACTING, L.P.	LOCKHART CONCRETE CO.	RAY BERTOLINI TRUCKING CO.	VIP CONSTRUCTION, INC.
PROJECT #1 Meadowbrook Blvd. - Montrose Drive Storm Sewer Improvement Project	\$205,323.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$192,949.00	\$116,920.00	\$109,707.09
PROJECT #2 Pembroke Court Storm Sewer Improvement Project	\$84,797.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$226,769.00	\$52,161.00	\$295,124.33
PROJECT #3 N. Gilwood Drive Storm Sewer Improvement Project	\$82,165.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$94,875.00	\$89,020.00	\$45,235.51
PROJECT #4 Meadowlark - Baumberger Storm Sewer Lining Project	\$116,590.00	\$82,742.00	\$107,856.00	\$173,914.00	No Bid	\$134,576.00