

City of Stow  
**PURCHASE OF MATERIALS (Items with Prevailing Wages)**

**BID OPENING - AUGUST 5, 2014**

DESCRIPTION	ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE	A & A SAFETY, INC.	BARBICAS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.	J. D. STRIPING & SERVICES, INC.	KARVO PAVING COMPANY	LOCKHART CONCRETE CO.	PERRIN ASPHALT COMPANY	SPANO BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 4B</b> - Asphaltic Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required) on City Streets	\$1,247,250.00	No Bid	\$1,517,200.00	No Bid	\$1,136,535.00	No Bid	\$1,313,850.00	No Bid
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 4C</b> - Asphaltic Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required) on Other City Infrastructure (Parking Lots and Paths)	\$87,900.00	No Bid	\$118,640.00	No Bid	\$91,830.00	No Bid	\$115,500.00	No Bid
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 5B</b> - Concrete - Finished, In Place	\$298,737.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$396,550.00	\$298,450.00	\$319,082.50
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 5D</b> - Remove Combination Curb and Gutter and Replace with Vertical Curb (Machine Placed)	\$94,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$81,200.00	\$96,700.00	No Bid
<b>TOTAL FOR ITEM 12</b> - Fast Dry Water-Based Paint	\$47,500.00	\$48,075.00	No Bid	\$43,905.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>APPLICATION FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE</b>	N/A	No	No	No	Yes	No	No	No