City of Stow

PURCHASE OF MATERIALS AND RENTAL OF EQUIPMENT
(Items without Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - MARCH 20, 2012

ALLIED BARBERTON BE'I'”;II'CI?UdCtJ)l;ING D &K DAVEY TREE DIVERSIFIED HD SUPPLY LOCKHART MACK NATIONAL LIME NEENAH PERRIN R.A. CRUISE |RAY BERTOLINI SHELLY MAT?EZIIEL_IL_\S( dba TSI_;_QA:;_E;_G&E TRUMBULL UTILITY SALES

ITEM DESCRIPTION CORPORATION, | TREE SERVICE, SAGAMORE MATERIALS, EXPERT REDI-MIX. LLC EJ USA, INC. |WATERWORKS, CONCRETE CO. CONCRETE, |MAR-ZANE, INC. & STONE CO. FOUNDRY ASPHALT SAND & TRUCKING MATERIALS, MEDINA PAVING CO. INDUSTRIES, AGENCY. LLC
INC. INC. COMPANIES INC. COMPANY ' LTD. INC. COMPANY COMPANY, INC.| GRAVEL, INC. COMPANY INC. SUPPLY INC. ' INC. ’

COMPANY

1 Limestone, 57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.79 $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Limestone, 304 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.32 $16.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Limestone, 1 & 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.67 $19.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Limestone, Type C Rock Channel Protection No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.85 $33.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Light Load Charge No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid $15.00 No Bid $5.00 $36.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Gravel, 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.15 $17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gravel, 304 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gravel, Bank Run No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.00 No Bid $9.00 No Bid $8.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gravel, 57 - Washed No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.25 $15.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.25 $15.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Mason Sand (Natural Sand Only) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.50 No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid $12.00 $9.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4A  |Asphalt Concrete 448, Type | Surface Course $60.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Concrete 448, Type Il Intermediate Course $52.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $53.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.50 No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Concrete 301 $51.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.00 No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Sand Mix $93.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $66.00 No Bid No Bid
5A [Class "C" Limestone Concrete No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $78.00 No Bid No Bid $87.00 $79.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $83.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Class "MS" Limestone Concrete No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $88.00 No Bid No Bid $94.00 $89.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Class "FS" Limestone Concrete No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.00 No Bid No Bid $99.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Low Strength Mortar Backfill - Type Il No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.00 No Bid No Bid $52.00 $58.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Removal of trees 1" - 3" in diameter No Bid $8.00 No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of trees 4" - 6" in diameter No Bid $17.00 No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of trees 7" - 9" in diameter No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid $56.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of trees 10" - 12" in diameter No Bid $43.00 No Bid No Bid $70.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of trees 13" - 18" in diameter No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stump grinding for trees 13" to 18" in diameter No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid $33.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
;estf;?tignlgt ZZZ;Z;TJS: removal or stump grinding No Bid $60.00 No Bid No Bid $77.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of trees 19" to 21" in diameter No Bid $162.50 No Bid No Bid $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stump grinding for trees 19" to 21" in diameter No Bid $75.00 No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
;e;‘tf;?tignz‘f, ZZZ;Z&TJE: removal or stump grinding No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid $95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of trees 22" to 24" in diameter No Bid $325.00 No Bid No Bid $900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stump grinding for trees 22" to 24" in diameter No Bid $75.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
;e;‘t;?tignzﬁ ZZZ;Z&TJE: removal or stump grinding No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid $126.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of trees 25" to 30" in diameter No Bid $425.00 No Bid No Bid $1,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stump grinding for trees 25" to 30" in diameter No Bid $100.00 No Bid No Bid $78.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
;e;‘t;;?tignggf, ZZZ;Z&TJE: removal or stump grinding No Bid $200.00 No Bid No Bid $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of trees 31" to 36" in diameter No Bid $565.00 No Bid No Bid $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Stump grinding for trees 31" to 36" in diameter No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid $140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Eeas‘;tiﬁtigngg, ZZZ;ZQTJ:: removal or stump grinding No Bid $275.00 No Bid No Bid $420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6A |3"-2500 Ib. Crush No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.87 $1.03
4" - 2500 Ib. Crush No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.17 $0.945
4" - 2500 Ib. Crush, Perforated No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.17 $0.945
6" - 2500 Ib. Crush No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.40 $2.05




City of Stow

PURCHASE OF MATERIALS AND RENTAL OF EQUIPMENT
(Items without Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - MARCH 20, 2012

ALLIED BARBERTON BE'I'”;II'CI?UdCtI)l:NG D &K DAVEY TREE DIVERSIFIED HD SUPPLY LOCKHART MACK NATIONAL LIME NEENAH PERRIN R.A. CRUISE |RAY BERTOLINI SHELLY MATsElllzkll:; dba TSL;_QAQ_E_)FG&E TRUMBULL UTILITY SALES
ITEM DESCRIPTION CORPORATION, | TREE SERVICE, SAGAMORE MATERIALS, EXPERT REDI-MIX. LLC EJ USA, INC. |WATERWORKS, CONCRETE CO. CONCRETE, |MAR-ZANE, INC. & STONE CO. FOUNDRY ASPHALT SAND & TRUCKING MATERIALS, MEDINA PAVING CO. INDUSTRIES, AGENCY. LLC
INC. INC. COMPANIES INC. COMPANY ' LTD. INC. COMPANY COMPANY, INC.| GRAVEL, INC. COMPANY INC. SUPPLY INC. ' INC. ’
COMPANY
6B |4" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.84 $0.96
6" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.00 $2.08
8" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.14 $3.74
10" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.22 $5.88
12" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.08 $8.44
15" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.00 $12.55
18" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.20 $20.38
21" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.06 $28.67
24" Sewer Main SDR 35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $37.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $64.00 $36.50
6C |3" Sanitary Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.19 $1.74
4" Sanitary Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.29 $3.85
6" Sanitary Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.49 $10.00
6" SDR 35 Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.37 $17.39
8" SDR 35 Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.97 $38.58
10" SDR 35 Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $123.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $157.07 $141.04
12" SDR 35 Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $185.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $225.70 $202.68
6" SDR 35 Sanitary Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.09 $24.32
8" SDR 35 Sanitary Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $83.32 $74.82
10" SDR 35 Sanitary Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $136.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $258.40 $232.04
12" SDR 35 Sanitary Tee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $195.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $361.02 $324.19
3"y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.12 $2.80
4"y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.71 $3.33
6"Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.76 $14.15
6"SDR35Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.08 $19.83
8"SDR35Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.51 $54.34
10"SDR35Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $155.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.71 $160.48
12"SDR35Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $216.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $249.90 $224.41
3" Cap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.89 $0.80
4" Cap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.17 $1.06
6" Cap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.30 $3.87
6" SDR 35 Cap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.74 $6.05
8" SDR 35 Cap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.22 $16.37
10" SDR 35 Cap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.99 $51.17
12" SDR 35 Cap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.62 $76.89
6" SDR 35 Plugs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.16 $3.74
8" SDR 35 Plugs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.77 $13.27
10" SDR 35 Plugs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.25 $44.23
12" SDR 35 Plugs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.86 $52.85
3" - 90° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.10 $1.89
4" - 90° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.79 $2.50
6" - 90° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.45 $12.08
6" SDR 35 - 90° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.41 $11.59
8" SDR 35 - 90° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.25 $32.07
10" SDR 35 - 90° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.96 $107.89
12" SDR 35 - 90° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $155.49 $139.62
3" - 45° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.48 $1.33
4" - 45° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.03 $1.82
6" - 45° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.02 $7.20
6" SDR 35 - 45° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.32 $10.17
8" SDR 35 - 45° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.69 $28.47
10" SDR 35 - 45° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $82.24 $73.85




City of Stow

PURCHASE OF MATERIALS AND RENTAL OF EQUIPMENT
(Items without Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - MARCH 20, 2012

ALLIED BARBERTON BE'I'”;II'CI?UdCtS)I;ING D &K DAVEY TREE DIVERSIFIED HD SUPPLY LOCKHART MACK NATIONAL LIME NEENAH PERRIN R.A. CRUISE |RAY BERTOLINI SHELLY MAT?E:IIEL_IL_\S( dba TSL;_QA:I\_?_G&E TRUMBULL UTILITY SALES
ITEM DESCRIPTION CORPORATION, | TREE SERVICE, SAGAMORE MATERIALS, EXPERT REDI-MIX. LLC EJ USA, INC. |WATERWORKS, CONCRETE CO. CONCRETE, |MAR-ZANE, INC. & STONE CO. FOUNDRY ASPHALT SAND & TRUCKING MATERIALS, MEDINA PAVING CO. INDUSTRIES, AGENCY. LLC
INC. INC. COMPANIES INC. COMPANY ' LTD. INC. COMPANY COMPANY, INC.| GRAVEL, INC. COMPANY INC. SUPPLY INC. ' INC. ’
COMPANY
6C |12" SDR 35 - 45° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $103.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $119.44 $107.25
Cont'd 3" - 22-1/2° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.10 $1.89
4" - 22-1/2° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.23 $2.01
6" - 22-1/2° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.78 $8.78
6" SDR 35 - 22-1/2° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.99 $9.87
8" SDR 35 - 22-1/2° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.98 $28.72
10" SDR 35 - 22-1/2° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.54 $78.61
12" SDR 35 - 22-1/2° Elbow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $99.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $114.15 $102.51
3" Coupling No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.17 $1.06
4" Coupling No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.34 $1.20
6" Coupling No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.92 $4.42
6" SDR 35 Coupling No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.77 $12.36
8" SDR 35 Coupling No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.38 $20.99
10" SDR 35 Coupling No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.89 $46.59
12" SDR 35 Coupling No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.53 $67.70
4" to 3" Reducer - 2500 Ib. Crush No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.48 No Bid
6" to 4" Reducer - 2500 Ib. Crush No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.54 No Bid
7 In Field Mix, Screened No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.00 $14.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8B |A) Bulldozer - D6 or Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bulldozer - D8 or Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
B) Front End Loaders - 2 C.Y. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Front End Loaders - 3 C.Y. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C) Air Compressor - 75 C.F.M. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Air Compressor - 125 C.F.M. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Air Compressor - 180 C.F.M. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D) Rollers - 5-8-T Tandem No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rollers - 8-10-T Tandem No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
E) Backhoes (Sm.) - 1/2 C.Y. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Backhoes (Sm.) - 3/4 C.Y. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F) TracHoe - Cat 312 or Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TracHoe - Cat 315 or Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TracHoe - Cat 320 or Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TracHoe - Cat 345 or Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
G) Grader - 8 Ft. Blade No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grader - 12 Ft. Blade No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H) Bobcat - Model 743B or Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bobcat - Model 843B or Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




City of Stow

PURCHASE OF MATERIALS AND RENTAL OF EQUIPMENT
(Items without Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - MARCH 20, 2012

ALLIED BARBERTON BE'I'”;II'CI?UdCtJ)};ING D &K DAVEY TREE DIVERSIFIED HD SUPPLY LOCKHART MACK NATIONAL LIME NEENAH PERRIN R.A. CRUISE |RAY BERTOLINI SHELLY MAT?EZIIEL_IL_; dba TSL;_QA:I\_[_)I_G&E TRUMBULL UTILITY SALES
ITEM DESCRIPTION CORPORATION, | TREE SERVICE, SAGAMORE MATERIALS, EXPERT REDI-MIX. LLC EJ USA, INC. |WATERWORKS, CONCRETE CO. CONCRETE, |MAR-ZANE, INC. & STONE CO. FOUNDRY ASPHALT SAND & TRUCKING MATERIALS, MEDINA PAVING CO. INDUSTRIES, AGENCY. LLC
INC. INC. COMPANIES INC. COMPANY ' LTD. INC. COMPANY COMPANY, INC.| GRAVEL, INC. COMPANY INC. SUPPLY INC. ' INC. ’
COMPANY

9 10" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" Diameter 16 Ga. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" Culvert Band No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 |EJIW 5116 Frame w/M2 Grate or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $274.53 $272.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $212.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW 5250 Frame w/Grate or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.00 $274.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $218.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW 5346 Frame w/M2 Grate or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $274.14 $292.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $252.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
igmjjjlgggz:"e /7030 T1 Back and M1 Grate or No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $460.00 $511.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $436.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW 7266 Curb Inlet or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $571.77 $610.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $453.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Eé:}g’l 7030 with T1 Back and M1 Grate or Approved No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $281.00 $363.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $349.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
g:ﬁgﬂiﬁ; Kio)((:kzo:t"sth:‘;vl;/ea:s and Bottom and No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
g:ﬁgﬂiﬁ; Kio)élfol\ft"sth:43v|;/::§ and Bottom and No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
g:ﬁgﬂiﬁ; Kio)élfol\ft"sth:44v|;/::§ and Bottom and No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW 5110 Type M3 Grate or Approved Equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
i’f;;g'fg E;Eig’”e%jss;j:;lérgtg r ii?ﬂ')r\?:dizuurg No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Precast Inlet Top with 4'6" x 6'0" Base No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
g(;'emz'f;grggi 2?;;2}?2&?&';‘;%24 x4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
gi:;ﬁgf;g’ggi 2?;;2}?2&?&';‘;%24 x4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" Riser for Concrete Catch Basin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" Riser for Concrete Catch Basin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" Riser for Concrete Catch Basin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW 1450 Manhole Adjusting Ring - Flared - 1-1/2" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $115.72 $123.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW 1450 Manhole Adjusting Ring - Flared - 2" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $129.67 $138.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW 1450 Manhole Adjusting Ring - Flared - 2-1/2" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $158.94 $169.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $123.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW 1450 Manhole Adjusting Ring - Flared - 3" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $168.71 $180.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $124.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5-1/4" Shaft Buffalo Style Water Box Adjusting Ring - 1" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.06 $16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.50 No Bid
i/ém Shaft Buffalo Style Water Box Adjusting Ring - 1- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.65 $18.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.50 No Bid
5-1/4" Shaft Buffalo Style Water Box Adjusting Ring - 2" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.34 $19.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.75 No Bid
5-1/4" Shaft Buffalo Style Water Box Adjusting Ring - 3" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.63 $21.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.95 No Bid
5-1/4" Shaft Buffalo Style Water Box Adjusting Ring - 4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.91 $23.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.50 No Bid




City of Stow

PURCHASE OF MATERIALS AND RENTAL OF EQUIPMENT
(Items without Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - MARCH 20, 2012

HELLY
BET TRUCKING = TALLMADGE
ALLIED BARBERTON INC. dba D &K DAVEY TREE DIVERSIFIED HD SUPPLY LOCKHART MACK NATIONAL LIME NEENAH PERRIN R.A. CRUISE |RAY BERTOLINI SHELLY MATERIALS dba ASPHALT & TRUMBULL UTILITY SALES
ITEM DESCRIPTION CORPORATION, | TREE SERVICE, SAGAMORE MATERIALS, EXPERT REDI-MIX. LLC EJ USA, INC. |WATERWORKS, CONCRETE CO CONCRETE, [MAR-ZANE, INC. & STONE CO FOUNDRY ASPHALT SAND & TRUCKING MATERIALS, MEDINA PAVING CO INDUSTRIES, AGENCY. LLC
INC. INC. INC. COMPANY ' LTD. ' INC. ' COMPANY COMPANY, INC.| GRAVEL, INC. COMPANY INC. SUPPLY v INC. ’
COMPANIES INC.
COMPANY
11 JD;E:!e Iron Pipe 6" CLS3, Cement Lined, Push-Type No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.75 No Bid

JD;ﬁ:!e Iron Pipe 8" CLS3, Cement Lined, Push-Type No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 No Bid
AWWA C-900 PVC Pressure Water Pipe, DR-14, 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.80 No Bid
AWWA C-900 PVC Pressure Water Pipe, DR-14, 8" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.95 No Bid
Mega Lugs, 4" (with Gaskets & Bolts) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.00 No Bid
Mega Lugs, 8" (with Gaskets & Bolts) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 No Bid
fgﬁggsp'pe' 6" Diameter, MJ Swivel & Solid, 24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.00 No Bid
fgr‘]’gt?]rsp'pe' 6" Diameter, MJ Swivel & Solid, 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $205.00 No Bid
Anchor Elbow (90°), 6" Diameter, MJ w/Rotating Rings No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $190.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.25 No Bid
Hydrant (Akron Standard) - AFC B-84-B-Red No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,029.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,955.45 No Bid
Chains, 5-1/4" x 5'6" Bury
Hydrant Break Flange Repair Kits: AFC, B-62-B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $193.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $163.00 No Bid
Hydrant Break Flange Repair Kits: AFC, B-84-B No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $172.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $144.75 No Bid
Zg’gra”t Break Flange Repalr Kits: Mueller, 5-1/4", A- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
:gdra”t Break Flange Repair Kits: lowa, 5-1/4", Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $142.00 No Bid
Hydrant Break Flange Repair Kits: Kennedy, K-81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $155.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $142.00 No Bid
Gate Valve, RS, C-515, MJ or AFC/Mueller ONLY, 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $556.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $515.00 No Bid
Gate Valve, RS, C-515, MJ or AFC/Mueller ONLY, 8" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $885.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $819.75 No Bid
Y?',,"foiox' 3 Piece, Screw Type ("Water" Imprinted Lid) 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.00 $42.98
;’?’,,"foiox' 3 Piece, Screw Type ("Water" Imprinted Lid) 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.00 $66.52
Valve Box, Middle - Bottoms 36" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.50 $60.48
Valve Box Bottoms - 11-1/16" Oval / 13-1/2" Round No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.00 No Bid
5:?:;'51&1'\2,,'\‘03’:;)” Coated, SS Strap Tap Saddles, 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.50 $24.78
5:?:;'51&1'\‘6,,'\‘03’:;)” Coated, SS Strap Tap Saddles, 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.55 $29.61
5:?:;'51&1'\;,,'\‘03’:;)” Coated, SS Strap Tap Saddles, 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.60 $35.36
Curb Stop, 300 psi, Coated Ball, fl x fl, 3/4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.00 No Bid
Curb Stop, 300 psi, Coated Ball, fl x fl, 1" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid
Curb Stop, 300 psi, Coated Ball, cmp x cmp, 1-1/4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.75 No Bid
Curb Stop, 300 psi, Coated Ball, cmp x cmp, 1-1/2" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $154.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 No Bid
Unions, 3-Part, cmp x cmp, 3/4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.90 No Bid
Unions, 3-Part, cmp x cmp, 1" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.45 No Bid
Unions, 3-Part, cmp x cmp, 1-1/4" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.65 No Bid
Curb Box, 94E, Buffalo Style, 2-1/2", Screw Type No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.75 $56.44
Curb Box Riser Rod (Cast Bottom) with Brass Cotter Pin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.50 No Bid
- 30" Rod, 1/2" Square Stock
T-Head Bolts/Nuts, Corten, 3/4", 4" Length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.35 No Bid
T-Head Bolts/Nuts, Corten, 3/4", 4-1/2" Length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.42 No Bid
T-Head Bolts/Nuts, Stainless Steel, 3/4", 4" Length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.05 No Bid
T-Head Bolts/Nuts, Stainless Steel, 3/4", 4-1/2" Length No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.52 No Bid
Romac SS1 Repair Clamp, 12" Length, 6" Pipe Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $82.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.65 $110.25
Romac SS1 Repair Clamp, 12" Length, 8" Pipe Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.99 $129.15
Romac SS1 Repair Clamp, 12" Length, 12" Pipe Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $145.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $122.15 $193.20
Romac SS1 Repair Clamp, 20" Length, 4" Pipe Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $107.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.25 $150.15
Romac SS1 Repair Clamp, 20" Length, 6" Pipe Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $127.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $114.25 $192.15
Romac SS1 Repair Clamp, 20" Length, 8" Pipe Size No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $146.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.95 $215.25
zf’mac SS1 Repalr Clamp, Tapped 3/4" cc, 12" Length, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.45 $117.60
gf’mac SS1 Repalr Clamp, Tapped 3/4" cc, 12" Length, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $84.05 $136.50
Romac SS1 Repair Clamp, Tapped 1" cc, 12" Length, 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $84.05 $155.40




City of Stow

PURCHASE OF MATERIALS AND RENTAL OF EQUIPMENT
(Items without Prevailing Wages)

BID OPENING - MARCH 20, 2012

SHELLY

ALLIED BARBERTON BE-I—”;II—EUd%I:NG D &K DAVEY TREE DIVERSIFIED HD SUPPLY LOCKHART MACK NATIONAL LIME NEENAH PERRIN R.A. CRUISE |RAY BERTOLINI SHELLY MATERIALS dba TSI_;_QA:;_E_JFG&E TRUMBULL UTILITY SALES
ITEM DESCRIPTION CORPORATION, | TREE SERVICE, SAGAMORE MATERIALS, EXPERT REDI-MIX. LLC EJ USA, INC. |WATERWORKS, CONCRETE CO CONCRETE, [MAR-ZANE, INC. & STONE CO FOUNDRY ASPHALT SAND & TRUCKING MATERIALS, MEDINA PAVING CO INDUSTRIES, AGENCY. LLC
INC. INC. INC. COMPANY ' LTD. ' INC. ' COMPANY COMPANY, INC.| GRAVEL, INC. COMPANY INC. SUPPLY v INC. ’
COMPANIES INC.
COMPANY
11 Romac SS1 Repair Clamp, Tapped 1" cc, 12" Length, 8" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $107.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.25 $157.50
Cont'd i " "
on ?Zo,,mac SS1 Repair Clamp, Tapped 1" cc, 12" Length, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $153.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.55 $220.50
13 |Wood Fiber No Bid No Bid $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Split Load Dumping Charge No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




