

City of Stow
PURCHASE OF MATERIALS AND RENTAL OF EQUIPMENT (Items With Prevailing Wages)
BID OPENING - May 29, 2012

DESCRIPTION	ALDEN EXCAVATING, INC.	ASPHALT FABRICS & SPECIALTIES, INC.	J. D. STRIPING & SERVICES, INC.	KARVO PAVING COMPANY	LOCKHART CONCRETE CO.	P.S. CONSTRUCTION FABRICS, INC.	PERRIN ASPHALT CO., INC.	SHELLY & SANDS, INC.	SPANO BROTHERS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.	TALLMADGE ASPHALT AND PAVING CO., INC.	TONY ZUMBO & SON CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.
TOTAL FOR ITEM 4B - Asphaltic Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished & Rolled as Required) on City Streets	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,052,305.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,065,485.00	\$1,358,920.00	No Bid	\$1,164,415.00	No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM 4C - Asphalt Materials (In Place in Stow, Hand Finished and Rolled as Required) on Other City Infrastructure (Parking Lots and Paths)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$137,625.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$121,900.00	\$169,010.00	No Bid	\$142,375.00	No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM 5B - Concrete - Finished, In Place	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$217,575.00	Bid as Read - \$205,950.00 (Error Found) Bid as Calculated by City of Stow - \$213,950.00	No Bid	\$177,425.00	No Bid	\$187,516.50	No Bid	\$203,650.00
TOTAL FOR ITEM 5E - HMA Crack Seal	No Bid	\$15,136.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24,519.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM 5F - Concrete Crack Seal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$13,442.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM 8A - Equipment Rental - Hourly with Operator											
A) Bulldozer - D6 or Equal	\$148.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bulldozer - D8 or Equal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
B) Backhoes (Sm.) - 1/2 C.Y.	\$105.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$150.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Backhoes (Sm.) - 3/4 C.Y.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
C) Ford 555 Backhoe/Loader or Equal w/Backhoe Operator and Laborer (Earth Work/Pipe Work)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$240.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
D) TracHoe - Cat 312 or Equal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TracHoe - Cat 315 or Equal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TracHoe - Cat 320 or Equal	\$156.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TracHoe - Cat 345 or Equal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
E) Cat 312 Trac Excavator w/Operator and Laborer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$225.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F) Cat 315 Trac Excavator or Equal w/TracHoe Operator and Laborer (Earth Work/Pipe Work)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$250.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
G) Grader - 8 Ft. Blade	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Grader - 12 Ft. Blade	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
H) Trucks - Net Capacity - 15 Tons	\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$75.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Trucks - Net Capacity - 20 Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$90.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Trucks - With Plow and Salt Spreader	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
I) Street Sweeper - Elgin Eagle Broom Sweeper or Equal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
J) Laborer - Asphalt Work	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
K) 8' Wide Roller - Vibratory Type	\$115.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL FOR ITEM 12 - Fast Dry Water-Based Paint	No Bid	No Bid	Bid as Read - \$29,610.00 (Error Found) Bid as Calculated by City of Stow - \$29,560.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
APPLICATION FOR LOCAL PREFERENCE	No	No	No	Yes	No	No	No	No	No	No	No